K.P. MEIRING COMPANY
TABULATION FOR BIDS FOR JUNE 15,2010

REFURBISHMENT OF ST.GEORGE APARTMENTS

2101 Boulevard Place
Indianapolis, IN 46207

BID PACKAGE #1 (Selective Demolition & Structural Wood Repair)

BID PACKAGE #2 (Masonry Restoration)

BID PACKAGE #1
BIDDER
H&H Drywall Corp

Fax - Non
EMI Drywall & Painting Responsive

Fax - Non
Indy Force Responsive

BID PACKAGE #2

BIDDER

Wells Masonry & Restoration, Inc

A-1 Masonry Restoration

Circle City Restoration, LLC

Kemna Restoration & Construction, Inc
Trisco Systems, Inc.

BASE BID

$ 93,365.00
$ 35,089.00
$ 42,600.00
BASE BID

$ 10,780.00
$ 14,570.00
$ 19,800.00
$ 24,732.00
$ 34,527.00

Radiators
ALT 1.1

$

3,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

Lintel/Base
ALT2.1A

H P B BH P

25,380.00
15,482.00
16,100.00
11,937.00
23,656.00

Unit Doors
ALT 1.2
$ 9,000.00

No Bid

$ 4,320.00

Lintel/All

ALT2.1B

$ 21,260.00
$ 11,532.00
$ 11,000.00
$ 41,500.00
$ 23,656.00

Base Bid R/R Plaster R/R Gypsum
ALT 1.3 Unit Price 1.1  Unit Price 1.2
$ 900.00 $ 6.00 $ 6.00
No Bid 10.85 10.85
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Complete
Cleaning Sealants Restore
ALT 2.2 ALT 2.3 ALT 2.4
$ 22,800.00 $ 16,536.00 $ 124,046.00
$ 13,944.00 $ 13,216.00 $ 129,552.00
$ 13,200.00 $ 16,500.00 $ 140,000.00
$ 14,660.00 $ 20,426.00 $ 89,586.00
$ 18,132.00 $ 14,795.00 $ 140,298.00



COMPLETE TIME
180 DAYS

None Indicated

None Indicated

120 DAYS
120 DAYS
150 DAYS
28 DAYS
30 DAYS



